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Agenda 
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Decision  
No. Document No (link) Draft decisions proposed for adoption: 

 

1  
 
 Note: 
 
 All documents are available 
online: 
 
https://unece.org/info/events/even
t/389334 
 
 
 
 

GRVA adopted the agenda proposed for its fifteenth session 
(ECE/TRANS/WP.29/GRVA/2024/15. 

2  
GRVA noted the report from the secretariat (GRVA-19-04) on the highlights of the last 
session (March 2024) of the parent body. 

3  
GRVA noted the information provided by the expert from SAE International on their 
committee activities on AI and agreed that they would provide input on this topic during 
the next meetings. 

4(a)  
GRVA noted GRVA-19-34 and agreed to refer it to the IWG on ADS 

GRVA endorsed the status report (GRVA-19-52) from the IWG on ADS  

4(b)  GRVA noted the arrangements proposed for GRVA workshops on ADS 

4(c)  
GRVA noted the completion of the work by IWG on Functional Requirements for 
Automated and Autonomous Vehicles (FRAV) and agreed to remove this item from its 
agenda. 

4(d)  

GRVA endorsed the status report (GRVA-19-18) from the the IWG on Validation 
Methods for Automated Driving (VMAD). 

… -12, -13 

-15 ? -15/Rev.1 

4(e)  GRVA adopted GRVA-19-22 

https://unece.org/info/events/event/389334
https://unece.org/info/events/event/389334
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4(f)  

GRVA endorsed the status report (GRVA-19-21) about the activities and deliverables of 
the IWG on Event Data Recorder / Data Storage System for Automated Driving 
(EDR/DSSAD). 

GRVA agreed with the proposed new timeline 

4(g)  
GRVA adopted GRVA-19-54 and requested the secretariat to submit it to WP.29 and 
AC.1 for consideration and vote in November 2024 

4(h) (i)  GRVA noted GRVA-19-49 (status report of the Task Force on FADS) 

4(h) (ii)  GRVA noted GRVA-19-46 (status report of the task force on AVC) 

4(h) (iii)  
GRVA noted GRVA-19-44 (wrap up workshop on scenarios) and agreed that a workshop 
be organized on this topic before the next GRVA session in September. 

4 (i)  GRVA noted GRVA-19-10 (and the corresponding presentation GRVA-19-39) 

5(a)  GRVA endorsed the status report (GRVA-19-40) of the IWG on CS/OTA. 

5(a)  

GRVA endorsed the status report (GRVA-19-51) on the activities of the Workshop on the 
implementation of UN Regulations Nos. 155 and 156. 

GRVA encouraged the organization of further workshops. 

GRVA also encourage exchange between the 1059 and 1998 Agreements CPs on this 
topic. 

5(b)  
GRVA noted that the members of the IWG on CS/OTA are invited to liaise with the expert 
from FIA to further develop their proposal. 

5(c)  
GRVA noted the information provided by the expert from ITU on their focus group on 
vehicular communication (GRVA-19-38) 

5(d)  
GRVA noted the information provided by the expert from IEEE on their committee 
activities on IEEE 2851 

6(a)  
GRVA endorsed a progress report (GRVA-19-35) from the TF on Advanced Driver 
Assistant Systems (ADAS).  

6(a)  
GRVA adopted ECE/TRANS/WP.29/GRVA/2024/23 with a correction in para. 2.28. 
reading: 
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2.28. “Non-Highway” means a type of road other than a highway as defined in 
paragraph 2.27. 

And requested the secretariat to submit it to WP.29 and AC.1 for consideration and vote 
at their November 2024 sessions. 

6(b)  

GRVA agreed to keep ECE/TRANS/WP.29/GRVA/2024/27 on its agenda. 

GRVA noted the general support for the proposal to introduce ELKS and the OICA 
suggestion to consider a new regulation instead of amending 2 UN Regulations. 

6(b)  
GRVA agreed to keep ECE/TRANS/WP.29/GRVA/2024/16 amended by GRVA-19-20 
on its agenda for the next session and also requested the secretariat to distribute GRVA-
19-33/Rev.1 with an official symbol at the September 2024 session.  

6(c)  
GRVA endorsed the status report (GRVA-19-47) of the IWG on ACPE 

GRVA adopted the revised terms of reference (GRVA-19-28) of the IWG on ACPE. 

6(c)  

GRVA adopted ECE/TRANS/WP.29/GRVA/2024/24 as amended by GRVA-19-29 and 
requested the secretariat to submit the proposal for a new UN Regulation on ACPE to 
WP.29 and AC:1 for consideration and vote at their November 2024 sessions. 

 

6(c)  
GRVA recommended to inform AC.3 at its June session on the desire to perform activities 
under the 1998 Agreement on this matter. 

7  
GRVA agreed to remove ECE/TRANS/WP.29/GRVA/2022/24 (UEBS) of the agenda for 
its next session. 

7  

GRVA noted GRVA-19-27, GRVA-19-30 and GRVA-19-31 (France) as well as  
GRVA-19-42 (UK) 

GRVA agreed to keep ECE/TRANS/WP.29/GRVA/2024/19 on its agenda for the 
September 2024 session.  

GRVA invited France to liaise with UK to produce consolidated documents for 
consideration in September 2024. 

7  

GRVA agreed to resume consideration of ECE/TRANS/WP.29/GRVA/2024/18 in 
September 2024. 

GRVA agreed to keep GRVA-19-05 on the agenda for the next session.  



Note by the secretariat Informal document GRVA-19-04 
19th GRVA, 25 June 2024 

Agenda item 14 
 

4 
 

8(b)  
GRVA adopted ECE/TRANS/WP.29/GRVA/2024/25 as amended by GRVA-19-23 and 
requested the secretariat to submit it for consideration and adoption in November 2024 

8(b)  
GRVA adopted ECE/TRANS/WP.29/GRVA/2024/26 as amended by GRVA-19-24 and 
requested the secretariat to submit it for consideration and adoption in November 2024 

8(b)  
GRVA agreed to resume consideration of ECE/TRANS/WP.29/GRVA/2024/28 in 
September 2024 session 

8(b)  
GRVA adopted ECE/TRANS/WP.29/GRVA/2023/10 as amended by part II of 
ECE/TRANS/WP.29/GRVA/2023/25 and requested the secretariat to submit it for 
consideration and adoption in November 2024 

8(c)  
GRVA adopted GRVA-19-11 and requested the secretariat to submit is as supplement to 
the 13 series of amendments to UN Regulation No. 13. 

8(c)  GRVA… ECE/TRANS/WP.29/GRVA/2024/22 

8(c)  GRVA… ECE/TRANS/WP.29/GRVA/2024/17 

8(c)   

9(b)  
GRVA agreed to keep ECE/TRANS/WP.29/GRVA/2024/21 on the agenda for its next 
session 

10  
 GRVA agreed to consult GRPE on the impact of the GRPE test procedure of brake 

particulate emissions on UN Regulation No. 10 at the June 2024 session. 

11  
 GRVA noted with thanks the information provided by the experts from China and UK on 

relevant activities in their country. 

12    

13(a)    

13(b)  

 GRVA noted that the next session of GRVA would take place during the same week as 
WP.1 

GRVA discussed the organization of sessions outside of Geneva. GRVA agreed that, if 
such session would be organized, the possibility for remote participation must be provided. 

13(c)    

13(d)    
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14  

 GRVA may wish to adopt this document with the following modifications: 

- 

- 

- 

 

 
______________ 


